AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

II

1191H CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 4

To enhance bilateral defense cooperation between the United States and
Israel, and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

FEBRUARY 12, 2025
Mr. Surravan (for himself, Mr. PETERS, Mr. BLUMENTHAL, Mr. RICKETTS,
and Ms. ROSEN) introduced the following bill; which was read twice and
referred to the Committee on Foreign Relations

A BILL

To enhance bilateral defense cooperation between the United

States and Israel, and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
2 twes of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
3 SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

4 This Act may be cited as the “United States-Israel
5 Defense Partnership Act of 2025,

6 SEC. 2. SENSE OF CONGRESS.

7 It is the sense of Congress that—
8 (1) the United States and Israel—
9 (A) are bound closely by historic and cul-

10 tural ties and mutual interests; and



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG T N T NG N NG I NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
[ T NG U N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O IR NO I e

SEC.

2

(B) face common threats, which are con-
stantly evolving in scope, scale, and lethality;

(2) to most effectively counter such shared
threats, the United States and Israel must expand
their defense partnership to develop new technologies
and leverage the unique capabilities offered by de-
fense industrial base of each country; and

(3) this Act furthers such goal through the es-
tablishment of several joint initiatives.

3. UNITED STATES-ISRAEL. PROGRAM ON COUN-
TERING UNMANNED SYSTEMS.

(a) FINDINGS.—Congress makes the following find-

(1) The increasing use of unmanned systems by
state and nonstate actors poses a significant threat
to the national security of the United States and its
allies, including Israel.

(2) Cooperation in developing and deploying
counter-unmanned systems technology will enhance
mutual security and strengthen bilateral defense ca-
pabilities.

(3) Israel is a global leader in the development
of advanced counter-unmanned systems technologies,
and a cooperative program will leverage shared ex-

pertise and resources to address evolving threats.

oS 554 IS



O o0 N N B W=

[\O I O B i e e e e e e e T
—_— O O o0 N N O nm R~ WD = O

22
23
24
25

3
(b) ESTABLISHMENT.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary of Defense,
with the concurrence of the Minister of Defense of
Israel, shall establish a cooperative program between
the United States and Israel, to be known as the
“United States-Israel Counter-Unmanned Systems
Program”, for the purpose of enhancing cooperation
between the United States and Israel for purposes
of—

(A) developing, testing, evaluating, and de-
ploying advanced technologies for countering
unmanned systems that threaten the United
States and Israel;

(B) sharing technical expertise and data
on emerging unmanned systems and related
threats;

(C) conducting joint research and develop-
ment initiatives; and

(D) deploying and integrating counter-un-
manned systems for mutual defense.

(2)  AcriviTiEs.—The program established

under this subsection shall include the following:
(A) Collaborative research initiatives in-
volving government, private sector, and aca-

demic institutions in the United States and

oS 554 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I N© TR NG T NS R NS R L e T e T e T e e T
A W N = O VWV 00 NN O W BN~ WD = ©

4

Israel, conducted in a manner that protects sen-
sitive technology and information and the na-
tional security interests of the United States
and Israel.

(B) Joint training exercises and informa-
tion-sharing mechanisms to enhance operational
readiness of personnel of the United States and
of Israel.

(C) The establishment, within the Depart-
ment of Defense, of a United States-Israel
Counter-Unmanned Systems Program Office to
oversee program execution and coordination.

(D) The procurement and deployment of

counter-unmanned systems.

(¢) ANNUAL REPORT.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 1 year after

the date of the enactment of this Act, and annually

thereafter, the Secretary of Defense shall submit to

the Committee on Armed Services of the Senate and

the Committee on Armed Services of the House of

Representatives a report on the immplementation of

the program established under this section.

oraph (1) shall include, for the preceding year

oS 554 IS

(2) ELEMENTS.

Each report required by para-




O o0 N N W BB W

|\ IR N© TR NG T NS R NS R L e T e T e T e e T T
A W N = O VWV 00 N O W BN~ WD = ©

5}

(A) a description of activities conducted
under the program;

(B) an assessment of progress made in ad-
dressing unmanned systems threats and re-
quirements;

(C) an assessment of the program’s col-
laboration with other relevant United States
Government programs, including the United
States-Israel  Operations-Technology Working
Group and Counter Unmanned Aerial Systems
program run by the Irregular Warfare Tech-
nical Support Directorate; and

(D) recommendations for future program
activities and funding.

(3) Form.—Each report submitted under para-
oraph (1) shall be submitted in unclassified form but
may include a classified annex as necessary to pro-
tect sensitive information.

(d) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—There is
authorized to be appropriated $150,000,000 for each of
fiscal years 2026 through 2030 to carry out the program
under this section.

(e) RULE OF CONSTRUCTION.—Nothing in this sec-

tion shall be construed to alter or supersede agreements

oS 554 IS



O o0 N N W B W =

[\© TN NO I N T NG N NS I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
L A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

6

or obligations between the United States and Israel in ex-
istence on the date of the enactment of this Act.
SEC. 4. EXTENSION AND MODIFICATION OF UNITED
STATES-ISRAEL ANTI-TUNNEL COOPERATION.
Section 1279 of the National Defense Authorization
Act for Fiscal Year 2016 (Public Law 114-92; 22 U.S.C.
8606 note) 1s amended—
(1) in  subsection (b)(4), by striking
“$50,000,000” and inserting “$80,000,000’; and
(2) in subsection (f), by striking “December 31,
2026”7 and inserting “‘December 31, 2028,
SEC. 5. EXTENSION AND MODIFICATION OF UNITED
STATES-ISRAEL COOPERATION TO COUNTER
UNMANNED AERIAL SYSTEMS.
Section 1278 of the National Defense Authorization
Act for Fiscal Year 2020 (22 U.S.C. 8606 note) is amend-
ed—
(1) in  subsection (b)(4), by striking
“$55,000,000” and inserting “$75,000,000’; and
(2) in subsection (f), by striking “December 31,
2026 and inserting ‘“‘December 31, 2028,
SEC. 6. UNITED STATES-ISRAEL EMERGING TECHNOLOGY
CAPABILITIES COOPERATION.
(a) STATEMENT OF Poricy.—lIt is the policy of the

United States to support and encourage further defense

oS 554 IS



O o0 N N W Bk W =

| \O JEE \© R \O R O B O B e e e e e T e e e
A W O = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

7

collaboration with Israel in areas of emerging technologies
capable of enabling the warfare capabilities of both the
United States and Israel to meet emerging defense chal-
lenges, including in the areas of artificial intelligence, cy-
bersecurity, robotics, quantum, and automation.

(b) AUTHORITY TO ESTABLISII EMERGING DEFENSE
TECHNOLOGY CAPABILITIES PROGRAM WITH ISRAEL.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary of Defense,
upon request by the Ministry of Defense of Israel
and in consultation with the Secretary of State and
the Director of National Intelligence, is authorized
to carry out, jointly with Israel, research, develop-
ment, test, and evaluation in areas of emerging tech-
nologies capable of enabling the warfare capabilities
of the United States and Israel to meet emerging de-
fense challenges, including in the areas of artificial
intelligence, cybersecurity, robotics, quantum, and
automation.

(2) PROTECTION OF SENSITIVE INFORMA-
TION.—Any activity carried out pursuant to the au-
thority provided by paragraph (1) shall be conducted
in a manner that appropriately protects sensitive in-
formation and the national security interests of the

United States and Israel.

oS 554 IS



O© 00 3 O WD B W N e

[\© TN NG T NG T NG I NG R NS B S e e T e e T e T e T e T
L A W NN = DO VO XN N R WND = O

8

(3) REPORT.—None of the activities described

in paragraph (1) may be carried out until the date

on which the Secretary of Defense submits to the

Committees on Armed Services of the Senate and

the House of Representatives a report that sets

forth the following:

oS 554 IS

(A) A memorandum of agreement between

the United States and Israel regarding sharing
of research and development costs for the capa-
bilities described in paragraph (1), and any

supporting documents.

(B) A certification that such memorandum

of agreement—

(1) requires sharing of costs of
projects, including in-kind support, be-
tween the United States and Israel;

(i1) establishes a framework to nego-
tiate the rights to any intellectual property
developed wunder the memorandum of
agreement; and

(ii1) requires the United States Gov-
ernment to receive semiannual reports on
expenditure of funds, if any, by the Gov-
ernment of Israel, including a description

of what the funds have been used for,



O o0 N N B W =

O TN NG I N T NG N NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ T NG U N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O B NO R e

9

when funds were expended, and an identi-
fication of entities that expended the
funds.

(¢) LEAD AGENCY.—Not earlier than the date on
which the Secretary of Defense submits the report re-
quired by subsection (b)(3), the Secretary of Defense shall
designate the Irregular Warfare Technology Support Di-
rectorate as the lead agency of the Department of Defense
in carrying out this section.

(d) SEMIANNUAL REPORTS.—The Secretary of De-
fense shall submit to the appropriate committees of Con-
oress on a semiannual basis a report that contains a copy
of the most recent semiannual report provided by the Gov-
ernment of Israel to the Department of Defense pursuant
to subsection (b)(3)(B)(1i11).

(e) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—There 1s

authorized to be appropriated $50,000,000 for each of fis-
cal years 2026 through 2030 to carry out the program
under this section.
SEC. 7. EXTENSION OF WAR RESERVES STOCKPILE AU-
THORITY.

Section 12001(d) of the Department of Defense Ap-
propriations Act, 2005 (Public Law 108-287; 118 Stat.
1011) is amended by striking “‘after January 1, 2027

and inserting “‘after January 1 2029”.

oS 554 IS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

|\ TN NG T N T NG I NG I N B e T e e T e e T T
L A W D= O O NN N Nl WD = O

10
SEC. 8. ESTABLISHMENT OF DEFENSE INNOVATION UNIT

OFFICE IN ISRAEL.
Not later than 180 days after the date of the enact-
ment of this Act, the Secretary of Defense shall establish

i Israel a Defense Innovation Unit office

(1) to engage the Minister of Defense of Israel
and representatives of the private sector in collabo-
rative efforts to counter development by Iran of
dual-use defense technologies; and

(2) to leverage resources and innovation activi-
ties of the United States and Israel for the benefit
of the national security of the United States and
Israel.

SEC. 9. NATIONAL TECHNOLOGY INDUSTRIAL BASE.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 90 days after the
date of the enactment of this Act, the Secretary of Defense
shall seek to engage the Minister of Defense of Israel in
a discussion of the process of the ascension of Israel into
the national technology and industrial base (as defined in
section 4801 of title 10, United States Code).

(b) PROTECTION OF SENSITIVE INFORMATION.—Any
activity carried out pursuant to the authority provided by
subsection (a) shall be conducted in a manner that appro-
priately protects sensitive information and the national se-

curity interests of the United States and Israel.

oS 554 IS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[\O I O R O R e e e e e e e T e T
N = OO0 0 NN N N R W N = O

23

11

SEC. 10. ASSESSMENT OF INTEGRATED AIR AND MISSILE

DEFENSE IN REGION COVERED BY UNITED
STATES CENTRAL COMMAND.

(a) ASSESSMENT REQUIRED.—The Secretary of De-

fense shall conduct an assessment of the integrated air
and missile defense in the region cover by United States

Central Command.

(b) ELEMENTS.—The assessment conducted pursu-

ant to subsection (a) shall cover the following:

(1) The current strength of the integrated air
and missile defense in the region described in sub-
section (a).

(2) How best to strengthen the integrated air
and missile defense described in paragraph (1).

(3) What would be required to expand or deep-
en cooperation among the United States, Israel, and
other regional partners of the United States to
achieve full operational capability of the integrated
air and missile defense described in paragraph (1),
including identification of the amount of funding
and new legal authorities that may be required for
such expansion or deepening.

(¢) CONSIDERATIONS.—In carrying out the assess-

24 ment required by subsection (a), the Secretary shall con-

25 sider the following:

oS 554 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

e T S N S Y e = T e T
O o0 N O »n B~ W NN = O

12

(1) The strategy required by section 1658(b) of
James M. Inhofe National Defense Authorization
Act for Fiscal Year 2023 (Public Law 117-263).

(2) Current cooperation among partners of the
United States in the region described by subsection
(a) on integrated air and missile defense.

(3) Lessons learned in countering the April 13,
2024, and October 1, 2024, airstrikes by Iran
against Israel.

(d) REPORT.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 180 days
after the date of the enactment of this Act, the Sec-
retary of Defense shall submit to the Committees on
Armed Services of the Senate and the House of Rep-
resentatives a report on the assessment conducted
under this section.

(2) ForM.—The report required by paragraph
(1) shall be submitted in unclassified form but may

contain a classified annex.

O

oS 554 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2025-03-11T22:06:46-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




