AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

1181TH CONGRESS
LN S, 3644

To reauthorize the HOME Investment Partnerships Program, and for other
purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

JANUARY 23, 2024
Ms. CorTEz MASsTO (for herself, Ms. Smrrii, Mr. FETTERMAN, and Ms.
RosEN) introduced the following bill; which was read twice and referred
to the Committee on Finance

A BILL

To reauthorize the HOME Investment Partnerships

Program, and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE; TABLE OF CONTENTS.

(a) SHORT TITLE.—This Act may be cited as the
“HOME Investment Partnerships Reauthorization and
Improvement Act of 20247,

(b) TABLE OF CONTENTS.—The table of contents for

o N N U B W

this Act is as follows:
See. 1. Short title; table of contents.

TITLE I—REAUTHORIZATION OF AND REFORMS TO HOME
INVESTMENT PARTNERSHIPS PROGRAM



S O o0 N9 N N R W

—_ = = =
N O O

2

See. 101. Reauthorization of Program.

q\, 10‘) I».;,.—‘,' P Os ‘—1 ] '\tx&t' N roQ POOQ

See. 102. Inerease in Program administration resources.

See. 103. Modifications of participating jurisdiction qualification threshold and
process for reallocations.

See. 104. Modification of jurisdictions cligible for reallocations.

TITLE II—REFORMS RELATING TO HOME INVESTMENT
PARTNERSHIPS PROGRAM ADMINISTRATION AND RULES

See. 201. Amendments to qualification as affordable housing.

See. 202. Elimination of commitment deadline.

See. 203. Reform of homeownership resale restrictions.

See. 204. Home property inspections.

See. 205. Revisions to strengthen enforecement and penalties for noncompliance.
See. 206. Tenant and participant protections for small-scale affordable housing.
See. 207. Establishment of home loan guarantee program.

TITLE III—REFORMS RELATING TO COMMUNITY HOUSING
DEVELOPMENT ORGANIZATION AND NONPROFIT PARTICIPATION

See. 301. Modification of rules related to community housing development orga-
nizations.

TITLE IV—TECHNICAL CORRECTIONS

See. 401. Technical corrections.

TITLE I—REAUTHORIZATION OF
AND REFORMS TO HOME IN-
VESTMENT PARTNERSHIPS
PROGRAM

SEC. 101. REAUTHORIZATION OF PROGRAM.

Section 205 of the Cranston-Gonzalez National Af-
fordable Housing Act (42 U.S.C. 12724) is amended to
read as follows:

“SEC. 205. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.

“There are authorized to be appropriated to carry out
this title—

“(1) $5,000,000,000 for fiscal year 2024;
“(2) $5,250,000,000 for fiscal year 2025;
“(3) $5,512,500,000 for fiscal year 2026;

*S 3644 IS



O o0 N N W B W =

[ T S S e e S T S e
O o0 N O »n B~ W N = O

20
21
22
23
24
25

Q
(3}

“(4) $5,788,125,000 for fiscal year 2027; and
“(5) $6,077,531,250 for fiscal year 2028.”.
SEC. 102. INCREASE IN PROGRAM ADMINISTRATION RE-
SOURCES.

Subtitle A of title II of the Cranston-Gonzalez Na-
tional Affordable Housing Act (42 U.S.C. 12741 et seq.)
1s amended—

(1) in section 212(c) (42 U.S.C. 12742(¢)), by
striking ““10 percent” and inserting “15 percent’’;
and

(2) in section 220(b) (42 U.S.C. 12750(b))—

2

(A) by striking “RECOGNITION.—"" and all
that follows through “A contribution” and in-
serting the following: “RECOGNITION.—A con-
tribution”; and

(B) by striking paragraph (2).
SEC. 103. MODIFICATIONS OF PARTICIPATING JURISDIC-
TION QUALIFICATION THRESHOLD AND

PROCESS FOR REALLOCATIONS.
Section 216 of the Cranston-Gonzalez National Af-
fordable Housing Act (42 U.S.C. 12746) is amended—

(1) in paragraph (3)(A)—

(A) by striking “(A) Except as provided in
paragraph (10), a jurisdiction” and inserting

the following:

*S 3644 IS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N e

[\O T \© R (O R S i e e e e e e e T
N = O 00NN R WD = O

4
“(A) ELIGIBILITY THRESHOLD.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—Except as pro-
vided in subparagraph (B), a jurisdiction’;
and
(B) by striking “or if the Secretary finds

that” and all that follows through the end of

“subject

clause (i1) and inserting the following:
to clause (i1).
“(i1) INFLATION ADJUSTMENT TO ELI-
GIBILITY THRESHOLD.—For each fiscal
vear after fiscal year 2024, the Secretary
shall adjust the threshold amount in clause
(i) for inflation.”;
(2) in paragraph (6)—
(A) in the matter preceding subparagraph
(A), by inserting “this title, including the re-
quirements in”’ after ‘“the requirements of”’;
and
(B) by striking “meet the requirements”
each place that term appears and inserting

“meet or comply with the requirements’; and

(3) by striking paragraph (10).

*S 3644 IS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[\ TR \© R N R \O T (O B e e e e e e T e e
A W O = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

-

J

SEC. 104. MODIFICATION OF JURISDICTIONS ELIGIBLE FOR
REALLOCATIONS.

Section 217(d) of the Cranston-Gonzalez National
Affordable Housing Act (42 U.S.C. 12747(d)) is amend-
ed—

(1) i paragraph (1), by striking the second
sentence and inserting the following: “Subject to
paragraph (3)(A), jurisdictions eligible for such re-
allocations shall include participating jurisdictions
and jurisdictions meeting the requirements of this
title, including the requirements in paragraphs (3),
(4), and (5) of section 216.”; and

(2) i paragraph (3), by striking “LIMITA-
TION.—Unless otherwise specified” and inserting the
following: “LIMITATIONS.—

“(A) REMOVAL OF PARTICIPATING JURIS-

DICTIONS FROM REALLOCATION.—The Sec-

retary may remove a participating jurisdiction

that fails to meet or comply with the require-
ments of this title from participation n re-
allocations of funds made available under this
title.

“(B) REALLOCATION TO SAME TYPE OF

ENTITY.—Unless otherwise specified”.

*S 3644 IS



1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

6

TITLE II—REFORMS RELATING
TO HOME INVESTMENT PART-
NERSHIPS PROGRAM ADMIN-
ISTRATION AND RULES

SEC. 201. AMENDMENTS TO QUALIFICATION AS AFFORD-
ABLE HOUSING.
Section 215 of the Cranston-Gonzalez National Af-
fordable Housing Act (42 U.S.C. 12745) is amended—
(1) in subsection (a)—

(A) in paragraph (1)(E), by striking all
that follows “purposes of this Act,” and insert-
ing the following: “‘except—

“(1) upon a foreclosure by a lender (or
upon other transfer in lieu of foreclosure)
if such action—

“(I) recognizes any contractual
or legal rights of public agencies, non-
profit sponsors, or others to take ac-
tions that would avoid termination of
low-income affordability in the case of
foreclosure or transfer in lieu of fore-
closure; and

“(IT) i1s not for the purpose of

avoiding low-income affordability re-

*S 3644 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN O T N T NG I NG T NG B e e T e e T e T e Y W =
[ N N O N N e = N Re - BN B e ) W ) B ~S O B NO R e

7

strictions, as determined by the Sec-

retary; or

“(i1) where existing affordable housing
18 no longer financially viable due to un-
foreseen acts or occurrences beyond the
reasonable contemplation or control of the
participating jurisdiction or owner that sig-
nificantly impact the financial or physical
condition of the housing, as determined by
the Secretary; and”’; and

(B) by adding at the end the following:

“(7) SMALL-SCALE HOUSING.—

“(A) DEFINITION.—In this paragraph, the

term ‘small-scale housing” means housing with

not more than 4 rental units.

“(B) ALTERNATIVE REQUIREMENTS.—

Small-scale housing shall qualify as affordable

housing under this title if—

*S 3644 IS

“(1) the housing bears rents that com-
ply with paragraph (1)(A);

“(i1) each unit is occupied by a house-
hold that qualifies as a low-income family;

“(i11) the housing is not refused for
leasing to a holder of a voucher under sec-

tion 8 of the United States Housing Act of



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ T NG U N N s = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O I NO R e

8
1937 (42 U.S.C. 1437f) because of the

status of the prospective tenant as a holder
of such voucher;
“(iv) the housing meets the require-
ments under paragraph (1)(E); and
“(v) the participating jurisdiction
monitors ongoing compliance of the hous-
ing with requirements of this title in a
manner consistent with the purposes of
section 226(b), as determined by the Sec-
retary.”’; and
(2) in subsection (b)(1), by striking “95 per-
cent”” and inserting “110 percent or a percentage es-
tablished by the Secretary through notice, whichever
is greater,”.
SEC. 202. ELIMINATION OF COMMITMENT DEADLINE.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 218 of the Cranston-Gon-
zalez National Affordable Housing Act (42 U.S.C. 12748)
1s amended—

(1) by striking subsection (g); and
(2) by redesignating subsection (h) as sub-
section ().

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section 218(¢) of
the Cranston-Gonzalez National Affordable Housing Act

(42 U.S.C. 12748(¢)) 1s amended

*S 3644 IS



O o0 N N B W =

[ w—
e

12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

9
(1) in paragraph (1), by adding “and” at the
end;
(2) by striking paragraph (2);
(3) by redesignating paragraph (3) as para-
oraph (2); and
(4) in paragraph (2), as so redesignated, by

striking “section 224”7 and inserting ‘“‘section 2237,

SEC. 203. REFORM OF HOMEOWNERSHIP RESALE RESTRIC-
TIONS.

Section 215 of the Cranston-Gonzalez National Af-
fordable Housing Act (42 U.S.C. 12745), as amended by
section 201, is amended—

(1) 1 subsection (b)—

(A) in paragraph (2), by redesignating
subparagraphs (A), (B), and (C) as clauses (i),
(1), and (1), respectively, and adjusting the
margins accordingly;

(B) by striking paragraph (3);

(C) by redesignating paragraphs (1), (2),
and (4) as subparagraphs (A), (B), and (D), re-
spectively, and adjusting the margins accord-
ingly;

(D) by inserting after subparagraph (B),

as so redesignated, the following:

*S 3644 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = O

*S 3644 IS

10

“(C) is subject to restrictions that are es-
tablished by the participating jurisdiction and
determined by the Secretary to be appropriate,
including with respect to the affordability pe-
riod, to—

“(1) require that any subsequent pur-
chase of the property be—

“(I) only by a person who meets
the qualifications specified under sub-
paragraph (B); and

“(II) at a price that is deter-
mined by a formula or method estab-
lished by the participating jurisdiction
that provides the owner with a reason-
able return on investment, which may
include a percentage of the cost of
any improvements; or
“(i1) in the case of resale, recapture

the investment provided under this title in

order to assist other persons in accordance
with the requirements of this title, except
where there are no net proceeds or where
the net proceeds are insufficient to repay

the full amount of the assistance; and’’;



O o0 N N W B W =

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R e T e T e D e e T
A W N = O VWV 00O N O W BN~ WD = O

11

(E) by striking “Housing that is for home-
ownership” and inserting the following:

“(1) QUALIFICATION.—Housing that 1is for
homeownership”’; and

(I') by adding at the end the following:
“(2)  PURCHASE BY COMMUNITY LAND

TRUST.—Notwithstanding subparagraph (C)(i) of
paragraph (1) and under terms determined by the
Secretary, a participating jurisdiction may permit a
community land trust to purchase housing that
meets the criteria under that paragraph—

“(A) in accordance with the terms of the
preemptive purchase option, lease, covenant, or
other legal instrument of the community land
trust when the terms and rights in the preemp-
tive purchase option, lease, covenant, or legal
instrument are and remain subject to the re-
quirements of this title;

“(B) when the purchase is for—

“(i) the purpose of—

“(I) entering into the chain of
title;

“(IT) enabling qualified home-

buyers on a waitlist to purchase;

*S 3644 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG T N T NG N NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N U N N = = N R - BN B o) W ) B ~S O T NO R e

12
“(ITI) performing necessary reha-
bilitation, repairs, or improvements;
or
“(IV) adding a subsidy; or
“(i1) another purpose determined ap-
propriate by the Secretary; and
“(C) if, within a reasonable period of time
after the applicable purpose under subpara-
oeraph (B) of this paragraph is fulfilled, as de-
termined by the Secretary, the housing is then
sold to a person who meets the qualifications
specified under paragraph (1)(B).

“(3) SUSPENSION OR WAIVER OF REQUIRE-

MENTS FOR MILITARY MEMBERS.—A participating
jurisdiction, in accordance with terms established by
the Secretary, may suspend or waive a requirement
under paragraph (1)(B) with respect to housing if
the owner of the housing—

“(A) is a member of a regular component
of the armed forces or a member of the Na-
tional Guard on full-time National Guard duty,
active Guard and Reserve duty, or inactive-duty
training (as those terms are defined in section

101(d) of title 10, United States Code); and

“(B) has received—

*S 3644 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\O I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W N = O O 0N N R WD = O

13
“(i) temporary duty orders to deploy
with a military unit or military orders to
deploy as an individual acting in support of

a military operation, to a location that is

not within a reasonable distance from the

housing, as determined by the Secretary,
for a period of not less than 90 days; or

“(i1) orders for a permanent change of
station.

“(4) SUSPENSION OR WAIVER OF REQUIRE-
MENTS FOR HEIR OR BENEFICIARY OF DECEASED
OWNER.—Notwithstanding subparagraph (C) of
paragraph (1), housing that meets the criteria under
that paragraph prior to the death of an owner may
continue to qualify as affordable housing if—

“(A) the housing is the principal residence
of an heir or beneficiary of the deceased owner,
as defined by the Secretary; and

“(B) the heir or beneficiary, in accordance
with terms established by the Secretary, as-
sumes the duties and obligations of the de-
ceased owner with respect to funds provided

under this title.”.

*S 3644 IS



14
SEC. 204. HOME PROPERTY INSPECTIONS.

Section 226(b) of the Cranston-Gonzalez National
Affordable Housing Act (42 U.S.C. 12756(b)) is amend-
ed—

(1) by striking “Each participating jurisdic-
tion” and inserting the following:
“(1) IN GENERAL.—Each participating jurisdic-

tion”’; and

NolENe B e Y, e~ L OV R \O)

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

(2) by striking “Such review shall include” and

all that follows and inserting the following:

“(2) ON-SITE INSPECTIONS.

“(A) INSPECTIONS BY UNITS OF GENERAL
LOCAL GOVERNMENT.—A review conducted
under paragraph (1) by a participating jurisdie-
tion that is a unit of general local government
shall include an on-site inspection to determine
compliance with housing codes and other appli-

cable regulations.

“(B) INSPECTIONS BY STATES.—A review
conducted under paragraph (1) by a partici-
pating jurisdiction that is a State shall include
an on-site inspection to determine compliance
with a national standard as determined by the

Secretary.

“(3) INCLUSION IN PERFORMANCE REPORT AND

PUBLICATION.—A participating jurisdiction shall in-

*S 3644 IS



O o0 N N D B W =

| \O 2R \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e T e e e e
A W O = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

15
clude in the performance report of the participating
jurisdiction submitted to the Secretary under section
108(a), and make available to the public, the results

of each review conducted under paragraph (1).”.

SEC. 205. REVISIONS TO STRENGTHEN ENFORCEMENT AND

PENALTIES FOR NONCOMPLIANCE.

Section 223 of the Cranston-Gonzalez National Af-

fordable Housing Act (42 U.S.C. 12753) is amended—

(1) in the heading, by striking “PENALTIES
FOR MISUSE OF FUNDS” and inserting ‘“‘PRO-
GRAM ENFORCEMENT AND PENALTIES FOR
NONCOMPLIANCE;

(2) in the matter preceding paragraph (1), by
inserting after “‘any provision of this subtitle” the
following: *‘, including any provision applicable
throughout the period required by section
215(a)(1)(E) and applicable regulations,’;

(3) in paragraph (2), by striking “or” at the
end;

(4) in paragraph (3), by striking the period at
the end and inserting ““; or”’; and

(5) by adding at the end the following:

“(4) reduce payments to the participating juris-

diction under this subtitle by an amount equal to the

*S 3644 IS



O o0 N N W B W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG N NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
b A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

16

amount of such payments which were not expended

in accordance with this title.”.

SEC. 206. TENANT AND PARTICIPANT PROTECTIONS FOR
SMALL-SCALE AFFORDABLE HOUSING.

Section 225 of the Cranston-Gonzalez National Af-
fordable Housing Act (42 U.S.C. 12755) is amended by
adding at the end the following:

“(e) TENANT SELECTION FOR SMALL-SCALE HoOUs-
ING.—Paragraphs (2) through (4) of subsection (d) shall
not apply to the owner of small-scale housing (as defined
in section 215(a)).”.

SEC. 207. ESTABLISHMENT OF HOME LOAN GUARANTEE
PROGRAM.

Subtitle A of title II of the Cranston-Gonzalez Na-
tional Affordable Housing Act (42 U.S.C. 12741 et seq.)
1s amended by adding at the end the following:

“SEC. 227. GUARANTEE AND COMMITMENT TO GUARANTEE
LOANS FOR ACQUISITION OF PROPERTY.

“(a) AUTHORITY.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary may, under
such terms and conditions as the Secretary may pre-
sceribe, guarantee and make commitments to guar-
antee, only to such extent or in such amounts as
provided in appropriation Acts, the notes or obliga-

tions 1issued by participating jurisdictions for the

*S 3644 IS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

|\ I O TR NG T NS R NS R L e T e T e T e e T
A W N = O VWV o0 N O N BN~ WD == O

17

purposes of financing the development or preserva-
tion of affordable rental and homeownership housing
through the acquisition, new construction, recon-
struction, or moderate or substantial rehabilitation

of affordable housing.

“(2) EL1GIBLE EXPENSES.—When in support
of the activities described in paragraph (1), the ex-
penses for which the Secretary may guarantee and
make commitments to guarantee notes or obligations
under that paragraph include real property acquisi-
tion, site improvement, conversion, demolition, and
other expenses, including financing costs and reloca-
tion expenses of any displaced person, family, or

business.

“(b) LIMITATIONS AND REQUIREMENTS.

“(1) EraGIBILITY.—A guarantee under this sec-
tion may be used to assist a participating jurisdie-
tion in obtaining financing only if the participating
jurisdiction—

“(A) has made efforts to obtain such fi-
nancing without the use of the guarantee, as
determined by the Secretary; and

“(B) cannot complete such financing con-

sistent with the timely execution of the project

*S 3644 IS



O o0 N N B W =

[\© TN NG I N T NS I NG R NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ N N O N N = = N R - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

18

plans without the guarantee, as determined by
the Secretary.

“(2) FORM, DENOMINATIONS, MATURITIES, AND

CONDITIONS.—Notes or other obligations guaranteed
under this section shall be in such form and denomi-
nations, have such maturities, and be subject to such
conditions as may be prescribed by regulations
issued by the Secretary.

“(3) REPAYMENT PERIOD.—The Secretary may
not deny a guarantee under this section on the basis
of the proposed repayment period for the note or
other obligation unless—

“(A) the period is more than 20 years; or

“(B) the Secretary determines that the pe-
riod causes the guarantee to constitute an unac-
ceptable financial risk.

“(4) AGGREGATE PRINCIPAL AMOUNT.—Not-
withstanding any other provision of law and subject
only to the absence of qualified applicants or pro-
posed activities and to the authority provided in this
section, to the extent approved or provided in appro-
priation Acts, the Secretary shall enter into commit-
ments to guarantee notes and obligations under this
section with an aggregate principal amount of not

more than—

*S 3644 IS



O o0 N N B W

|\ I N© TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e T e e T
A W N = O VWV o0 N O N BN~ WD == ©

19
“(A) $2,000,000,000 for fiscal year 2023;
and
“(B) for each subsequent fiscal year, an
amount that is increased for inflation as deter-

mined by the Secretary.

“(¢) PREREQUISITES.—The Secretary may not make
a guarantee or commitment to guarantee with respect to
any note or other obligation if—

“(1) the total outstanding notes or obligations
of the issuer guaranteed under this section would
thereby exceed an amount equal to 5 times the most
recent allocation for the issuer under this title; or

“(2) the Secretary determines that the guar-
antee constitutes an unacceptable risk.

“(d) PAYMENT OF PRINCIPAL, INTEREST, AND
Costs.—Notwithstanding any other provision of this Act,
a participating jurisdiction allocated funds under this Act
may use the funds (including program income derived
therefrom) for the payment of principal and interest due
(including such servicing, underwriting, or other costs as
may be specified in regulations of the Secretary), and any
associated fee to be paid in accordance with subsection (k),
on a note or other obligation guaranteed under this sec-

tion.

*S 3644 IS



O o0 N N W Bk W

[\ TN NG I N T NG I NG R NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N = = N R - BN B e ) W ) TR~ O I NO S e

20
“(e) REPAYMENT CONTRACT; SECURITY; PLEDGE BY
PARTICIPATING JURISDICTION.—T0 assure the repayment
of a note or other obligation guaranteed under this section
and related charges incurred under this section, and as
a condition of receiving such a guarantee, the Secretary
shall require the issuer of the note or other obligation to—

“(1) enter into a contract, in a form acceptable
to the Secretary, for repayment of the note or other
obligation;

“(2) pledge as security the proceeds of any
erant for which the issuer may become eligible under
this Act; and

“(3) furnish, at the discretion of the Secretary,
such other security as may be determined appro-
priate by the Secretary in making the guarantee, in-
cluding increments in local tax receipts generated by
the activities assisted under this Act or proceeds

from the sale of land or rehabilitated property.

The

“(f) PLEDGED GRANTS FOR REPAYMENTS.
Secretary may, notwithstanding any other provision of this
Act, apply the proceeds of a grant pledged by a partici-
pating jurisdiction under subsection (e)(2) to any repay-
ment due the United States as a result of the guarantee
under this section of a note or other obligation issued by

the participating jurisdiction.

*S 3644 IS



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

21

“(o) FuLL FArro AND CREDIT OF UNITED STATES;
CONCLUSIVENESS AND VALIDITY OF GUARANTEE.—

“(1) FUuLL FAITH AND CREDIT OF UNITED
STATES PLEDGED FOR PAYMENT.—The full faith
and credit of the United States is pledged to the
payment of a note or other obligation guaranteed
under this section.

“(2) CONCLUSIVENESS AND VALIDITY OF GUAR-

ANTEE.—

“(A) CONCLUSIVENESS.—A  guarantee
made by the Secretary under this section shall
be conclusive evidence of the eligibility of the
oblication for the guarantee with respect to
principal and interest.

“(B) VArLipITY.—The validity of a guar-
antee made by the Secretary under this section
shall be incontestable in the hands of a holder
of the guaranteed obligation.

“(3) LIMITATION ON PERCENTAGE.—A guar-
antee made under this section shall guarantee repay-
ment of 100 percent of the unpaid principal and in-
terest due on the notes or other obligations guaran-

teed.

*S 3644 IS



O o0 9 AN U B~ W N

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

22

“(h) TAXATION OF INTEREST; GRANTS TO ISSUING

PARTICIPATING  JURISDICTION;  HARDSHIP  ASSIST-

ANCE.—

“(1) TAXATION OF INTEREST PAID ON GUARAN-

TEED OBLIGATIONS.

For purposes of the Internal
Revenue Code of 1986, interest paid on an obliga-
tion issued by a participating jurisdiction that is
cuaranteed under this section shall be included in
the gross income of the recipient of the interest.

“(2) GRANTS TO ISSUING PARTICIPATING JU-
RISDICTION OF TAXABLE OBLIGATIONS FOR NET IN-
TEREST COSTS.—The Secretary may make, or con-
tract to make, grants, in such amounts as may be
approved in appropriation Acts, to or on behalf of
the issuing participating jurisdiction to cover not to
exceed 30 percent of the net interest cost of obliga-
tions issued by the participating jurisdiction that are
ouaranteed under this section.

“(3) ASSISTANCE TO ISSUER IN IARDSHIP

CASES.—The Secretary may, to the extent approved

in appropriation Acts, assist the issuer of a note or
other obligation guaranteed under this section in the
payment of all or a portion of the principal and in-
terest amount due under the note or other obliga-

tion, if the Secretary determines that the issuer is

*S 3644 IS



[E—

O o0 9 N U B W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

23

unable to pay the amount because of circumstances
of extreme hardship beyond the control of the issuer.

“(1) LiMIT ON OUTSTANDING OBLIGATIONS; MONI-

TORING USE OF GUARANTEES.

“(1) LIMIT ON OUTSTANDING OBLIGATIONS.
The total amount of outstanding obligations guaran-
teed on a cumulative basis by the Secretary under
this section may not at any time exceed the greater
of—

“(A) $4,500,000,000; or

“(B) such higher amount as may be au-
thorized to be appropriated to carry out this
section for a fiscal year.

“(2) MONITORING USE OF GUARANTEES.

“(A) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall
monitor the use of guarantees under this sec-
tion by participating jurisdictions.

“(B) ACTIONS TO ENSURE SUFFICIENT
AUTHORITY.—If the Secretary finds under sub-
paragraph (A) that 50 percent of the aggregate
cuarantee authority under paragraph (1) has
been committed, the Secretary may—

“(1) provide that a unit of general
local government that receives a grant

under section 211 may not receive more

*S 3644 IS



O o0 N N Bk W =

|\ I O TR NG T NS R NS R L e T e T e T e e T
A W N = O VWV 00 NN O B BN~ WD = O

24

than $35,000,000 in guarantees under this
section; or

“(i1) submit to Congress a request for
the enactment of legislation increasing the
amount of the aggregate guarantee author-
ity.

“(j) PURCHASE OF GUARANTEED OBLIGATIONS BY
FEDERAL FINANCING BANK.—The Federal Financing
Bank may not purchase a note or other obligation guaran-
teed under this section.

“(k) ImPOSITION OF FEE OR CHARGE.—The Sec-
retary shall collect fees from borrowers to result in a credit
subsidy cost of zero for guaranteeing notes or other obliga-
tions under this section.

“()  GUARANTEE OF OBLIGATIONS BACKED BY
LoOANS.—

“(1) AurtoriTty.—The Secretary may, upon
such terms and conditions as the Secretary considers
appropriate, guarantee the timely payment of the
principal of and interest on such trust certificates or
other obligations as may be—

“(A) offered by the Secretary or by any
other offeror approved for purposes of this sub-

section by the Secretary; and

*S 3644 IS



O o0 N N D BB W =

[\ I \© R \O I O R N i e e e e T e T e e
W N = O O 0N N RN = O

25
“(B) based on and backed by a trust or
pool composed of notes or other obligations
cuaranteed or eligible for guarantee by the Sec-
retary under this section.

“(2) FuLL FAITH AND CREDIT.—To the same
extent as provided in subsection (g), the full faith
and credit of the United States is pledged to the
payment of all amounts that may be required to be
paid under any guarantee made by the Secretary
under this subsection.

“(3) SUBROGATION.—If the Secretary pays a
claim under a guarantee made under this section,
the Secretary shall be subrogated for all the rights
of the holder of the guaranteed certificate or obliga-

tion with respect to the certificate or obligation.

“(4) EFFECT OF OTHER LAWS.—No State or
local law, and no Federal law, shall preclude or limit
the exercise by the Secretary of—

“(A) the power to contract with respect to
public offerings and other sales of notes, trust
certificates, and other obligations guaranteed
under this section upon such terms and condi-

tions as the Secretary determines appropriate;

*S 3644 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG I N T NG N NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e
L A W D= O O NN N N R, WD = O

26

“(B) the right to enforce any contract de-
seribed in subparagraph (A) by any means de-
termined appropriate by the Secretary; or

“(C) any ownership rights of the Seec-
retary, as applicable, in notes, certificates, or
other obligations guaranteed under this section,
or constituting the trust or pool against which
trust certificates, or other obligations guaran-

teed under this section, are offered.”.

TITLE III—REFORMS RELATING
TO COMMUNITY HOUSING DE-
VELOPMENT ORGANIZATION
AND NONPROFIT PARTICIPA-
TION

SEC. 301. MODIFICATION OF RULES RELATED TO COMMU-
NITY HOUSING DEVELOPMENT ORGANIZA-
TIONS.

(a) DEFINITIONS OF COMMUNITY HOUSING DEVEL-
OPMENT  ORGANIZATION AND  COMMUNITY  LAND
TRUST.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 104 of the Cran-
ston-Gonzalez National Affordable Housing Act (42
U.S.C. 12704) is amended—

(A) in paragraph (6)(B)—

(1) by striking “‘significant”; and

*S 3644 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

27

(i1) by striking “and otherwise” and
inserting “or as otherwise determined ac-
ceptable by the Secretary’”’; and
(B) by adding at the end the following:

“(26) The term ‘community land trust’ means
a nonprofit entity or a State or local government or
instrumentality thereof that—

“(A) 1s not sponsored by a for-profit orga-
nization;

“(B) has as a primary purpose the provi-
sion and maintenance of housing that provides
long-term affordability for low- and moderate-
meome persons;

“(C) provides housing described in sub-
paragraph (B) using a ground lease, deed cov-
enant, or other similar legally enforceable meas-
ure, as determined by the Secretary, that—

“(1) keeps the housing affordable to
low- and moderate-income persons for not
less than 30 years; and

“(i1) enables low- and moderate-in-
come persons to purchase the housing for
homeownership; and
“(D) maintains preemptive purchase op-

tions to purchase the property so the housing

*S 3644 IS



O o0 9 N U B W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

28

remains affordable to low-and moderate-income

persons.”’.

(2) ELIMINATION OF EXISTING DEFINITION OF
COMMUNITY LAND TRUST.—Section 233 of the
Cranston-Gonzalez National Affordable Housing Act
(42 U.S.C. 12773) is amended by striking sub-
section (f).

(b) SET-ASIDE FOR COMMUNITY HOUSING DEVEL-

OPMENT ORGANIZATIONS.—Section 231 of the Cranston-

Gonzalez national Affordable Housing Act (42 U.S.C.
12771) 1s amended—

(1) in subsection (a), by striking ‘“‘to be devel-
oped, sponsored, or owned by community housing
development organizations” and inserting “when a
community housing development organization mate-
rially participates in the ownership or development
of such housing, as determined by the Secretary’’;

(2) by striking subsection (b) and inserting the
following:

“(b) RECAPTURE AND REUSE.—If any funds re-
served under subsection (a) remain uninvested for a period
of 24 months, then the Secretary shall make such funds
available to the participating jurisdiction for any eligible

activities under this title without regard to whether a com-

*S 3644 IS



O o0 N N B W =

| \O JEE \© R \O R O B O B e e e e e T e e e e
A W = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

29

munity housing development organization materially par-

ticipates in the use of the funds.”; and

(3) by striking subsection (c¢).

TITLE IV—-TECHNICAL
CORRECTIONS

SEC. 401. TECHNICAL CORRECTIONS.

The Cranston-Gonzalez National Affordable Housing

Act (42 U.S.C. 12701 et seq.) is amended—

(1) in section 104 (42 U.S.C. 12704)—

(A) by redesignating paragraph (23) (re-
lating to the definition of the term “to dem-
onstrate to the Secretary’”) as paragraph (22);
and

(B) by redesignating paragraph (24) (re-
lating to the definition of the term “insular
area’’, as added by section 2(2) of Public Law
102-230) as paragraph (23);

(2) 1 section 105(b) (42 U.S.C. 12705(b))—

(A) in paragraph (7), by striking “Stewart
B. McKinney Homeless Assistance Aet” and in-
serting “McKinney-Vento Homeless Assistance
Act”’; and

(B) in paragraph (8), by striking ‘‘sub-

paragraphs’” and inserting ‘‘paragraphs’;

*S 3644 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

30

(3) in section 106 (42 U.S.C. 12706), by strik-
ing “Stewart B. McKinney Homeless Assistance
Act” and inserting “McKinney-Vento Homeless As-
sistance Act’’;

(4) 1 section 108(a)(1) (42 U.S.C.
12708(a)(1)), by striking “‘section 105(b)(15)” and
inserting “‘section 105(b)(18)";

(5) in section 212 (42 U.S.C. 12742)—

(A) 1n subsection (a)—

(1) in paragraph (3)(A)(i1), by insert-
ing “‘United States” before “Housing Act”’;
and

(1) by redesignating paragraph (5) as
paragraph (4);

(B) in subsection (d)(5), by inserting

“United States” before “Housing Act”’; and

(C) 1n subsection (e)(1)—

(1) by striking “section 221(d)(3)(ii)”
and inserting “section 221(d)(4)”’; and

(i1) by striking “not to exceed 140
percent” and inserting “as determined by
the Secretary’’;

(6) in section 215(a)(6)(B) (42 U.S.C. 20
12745(a)(6)(B)), by striking “erand children” and

inserting “‘erandchildren’;

*S 3644 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ I \© R \O I O N N e e e e e e D e e
W = O O 0N N RN = O

*S 3644 IS

31

(7) in section 217 (42 U.S.C. 12747)—

(A) in subsection (a)—

2

(1) in paragraph (1), by striking “(3)
and inserting “(2)"’;

(i) by striking paragraph (3), as
added by section 211(a)(2)(D) of the
Housing and Community Development Act
of 1992 (Public Law 102-550; 106 Stat.
3756); and

(111) by redesignating the remaining
paragraph (3), as added by the matter
under the heading “HOME INVESTMENT
PARTNERSIHIPS PROGRAM” under the head-
ing “HOUSING PROGRAMS” in title IT of
the Departments of Veterans Affairs and
Housing and Urban Development, and
Independent Agencies Appropriations Act,
1993 (Public Law 102-389; 106 Stat.
1581), as paragraph (2); and
(B) in subsection (b)—

(1) in paragraph (1)—

(I) in the first sentence of sub-

paragraph (A)—



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

*S 3644 IS

(aa) by striking “in regula-

tion” and inserting ““, by regula-

tion,”; and

(bb) by striking “eligible ju-

risdiction”” and inserting “‘eligible
jurisdictions”; and

(IT) in subparagraph (F)—

(aa) in the first sentence—
(AA) in clause (i), by
striking ““‘Subcommittee on
Housing and Urban Affairs”
and inserting “Sub-
committee  on  Housing,
Transportation, and Com-
munity Development”; and
(BB) in clause (i1), by
striking ““‘Subcommittee on
Housing and Community
Development of the Com-
mittee on Banking, Finance
and Urban Affairs” and in-
serting  “‘Subcommittee on
Housing and Insurance of
the Committee on Financial

Services”’; and



O o0 N N W BB W

| \O JEE \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e e e e e
A LW O = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

(bb) in the second sentence,
by striking ‘“‘the Committee on
Banking, Finance and Urban Af-
fairs of the ITouse of Representa-
tives” and inserting ‘“‘the Com-
mittee on Financial Services of
the House of Representatives’;

(i) in paragraph (2)(B), by striking
“$500,000” each place that term appears
and inserting “$750,000";

(ii1) in paragraph (3)—

(I) by striking “$500,000” each
place that term appears and inserting
“$750,000”; and

(IT) by striking ““, except as pro-
vided in paragraph (4)”; and
(iv) by striking paragraph (4);

(8) 1n section 220(¢) (42 U.S.C. 12750(¢))—
(A) in paragraph (3), by striking ‘“Sec-

)

retary”’ and all that follows and inserting ‘“Sec-
retary;’’;

(B) in paragraph (4), by striking “under
this title” and all that follows and inserting

“under this title;”’; and

*S 3644 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

I S T
B~ W NN = O

34
(C) by redesignating paragraphs (6), (7),
and (8) as paragraphs (5), (6), and (7), respec-
tively;
(9) in section 225(d)(4)(B) (42 U.S.C.
12755(d)(4)(B)), by striking “for” the first place

that term appears; and

(10) in section 283 (42 U.S.C. 12833)
(A) in subsection (a), by striking “Bank-
ing, Finance and Urban Affairs” and inserting
“Financial Services”; and
(B) in subsection (b), by striking “General
Accounting Office” each place that term ap-
pears and inserting “Government Account-

ability Office”.

*S 3644 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2024-02-06T20:03:39-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




